
BID TABULATION SHEET

    HEAVY AND LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS TAB 16/17
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Durango, Traverse or Mfg Equal PD 0704,0957,0701,0715 NB $26,373.00 $27,620.00 NB $26,938.00 $27,063.00 NB

Equinox, Journey, Terrain or Mfg Equal PD 0712 NB $22,111.00 $22,083.00 NB $26,497.00 $21,983.00 NB

Chevy Impala or Mfg Equal PD 0801 NB $22,355.00 NB NB $24,175.00 $21,904.00 NB

F150 SWB or Mfg Equal PD Animal Service 1030 NB $25,002.00 $23,400.00 $23,741.00 $26,197.00 NO BID NB

F150 SWB or Mfg Equal Park Ops 1248 NB $28,601.00 $24,169.00 $24,554.00 $25,767.00 NO BID NB

F150 SWB Ext Cab or Mfg Equal Comm Dev 0509 NB $27,258.00 $23,923.00 $24,359.00 $26,407.00 NO BID NB

F150 4x4 Crew cab or Mfg Equal Drainage 0806, 0726 NB $33,735.00 $30,320.00 $29,553.00 $33,220.00 NO BID NB

F750 Reg Cab w/ Flatbed or Mfg Equal Street 0619 $72,658.00 $75,554.00 NB NB NB NO BID $82,375.00

RD690S 12-14 Yd Dump or Mfg Equal Street 0620 NB NB NB NB NB NO BID

F150 SWB 4x4 Crew Cab of Mfg Equal Engineer 0548 NB $32,759.00 $31,420.00 $29,161.00 $32,450.00 NO BID NB

C1500 LWB Reg cab w/ Service Bed or Mfg Equal UB 1004 NB $28,862.00 NB NB $29,200.00 NO BID NB

F750 Cab & Chassis 5-7 Yd Dump Bed or Mfg Equal $72,382.00 $76,004.00 NB NB NB NO BID $79,870.00
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